Sec. 22-421. - Adoption of the International Residential Code.

The 2012 International Residential Code, copyrighted by the International Code Council, Inc., save
and except the amendments set forth in exhibit "A", attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes, and including the addendum, ("2012 International Residential Code"), is hereby adopted,
prescribing regulations applicable to all residential structures and existing premises and constitutes
minimum requirements and standards for construction applications. The 2012 International Residential
Code is made a part of this article as if fully set forth herein. One copy of the 2012 International Residential
Code is on file in the office of the city secretary being marked and designated as the 2012 International
Residential Code.

(Ord. No. 2013-12, §§ 2, 3, 2-26-2013)

Sec. 22-422. - Amendments to the International Residential Code.
The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2012 International Residential Code are
hereby amended as follows:

Section R102.4; amended to read as follows:

R102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes, when specifically adopted, and standards
referenced in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed
extent of each such reference and as further regulated in Sections R102.4.1 and R102.4.2.
Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each
reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well.
Any reference made to NFPA 70 or the Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted.

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced
codes. Note: the former ICC Electrical Code is now Appendix K of the IBC, but no longer called by that
name. If adopting in that location, be sure to include language that includes structures under IRC and
IBC.)

R105.2 Work exempt from permit:
Building: Delete numbers: 1, 2, 5 and 10. Renumber remaining.

Delete
Delete
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
Delete
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)

(existing unchanged)

© ©® N o g s~ wDd PR

(existing unchanged)
10. Delete
Section R110 (delete sections R110.2 through R110.5):

Page 1



Change 110.1 Use and occupancy to read as follows: The Building Official may, on an as needed
basis upon written request, issue a Certificate of Occupancy. Issuance of a certificate of
occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of
other ordinances of the City of Wylie. Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel
the provisions of this Code or other ordinances of the City of Wylie shall not be valid.

(Reason: Issuing COs for residences is not a common practice in the area.)
Section R112.2.1 and R112.2.2; delete the sections.

(Reason: Floodplain provisions are addressed locally.)

Section R202; amended definition of "Townhouse" to read as follows:

TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a group of three or more attached
units separated by property lines in which each unit extends from foundation to roof and with a
yard or public way on at least two sides.

(Reason: Consistent with terminology commonly used in this region.)
Table R301.2(1); fill in as follows:
WIND DESIGN

GROUND SNOW LOAD SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY'
SPEEDY (mph) Topographic Effects*

90 (3-sec-gust)/76
5 l/ft2 (3-sec-gust)/ No A
fastest mile

SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM

Weathering? Frost line depth® Termite®
moderate 6" very heavy
WINTER DESIGN | ICE BARRIER UNDERLAYMENT FLOOD AIR FREEZING | MEAN ANNUAL
TEMP® REQUIRED" HAZARDSS® INDEX TEMP!

Page 2



22°F

No local code 150 64.9°F

(No change to footnotes)

(Reason: To promote regional uniformity.)

Section R302.1; add exception #6 to read as follows:

Exceptions:

1.

o g M w D

(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)

Open non-combustible carport structures may be constructed when also approved
within adopted ordinances.

(Reason: Refers to other ordinances, such as zoning ordinances.)

Section R302.2, Exception; amended to read as follows:

Exception: A common two-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly, or one-hour fire-resistance-
rated wall assembly when equipped with a sprinkler system... (remainder unchanged)

(Reason: Consistent with regional practice.)

Section R302.2.4, Exception 5; amended to read as follows:

Exception:

1.

2
3
4,
5

(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)

Townhouses separated by a common fire-resistance-rated wall as provided in Section
R302.2.

(Reason: Consistent with regional practice.)

Section R302.3; add Exception #3 to read as follows:

Exceptions:
1. (existing text unchanged)
2. (existing text unchanged)
3.  Two-family dwelling units that are also divided by a property line through the structure

shall be separated as required for townhouses.

Page 3



(Reason: Provide guidance for a common construction method in this area. Correlates with
amendment to IRC Section R202 Townhouse definition.)

R308.4.7; amended to read as follows: Glazing adjacent to the landing at bottom of a stairway where
the glazing is less than 60 inches above the landing and within 60 inches horizontally of the bottom
tread shall be considered a hazardous location.

Section R315.3; amend to read as follows and add exception #2 as follows:

Where required in existing dwellings. Where work requiring a permit for an addition or an alteration
that occurs in existing dwellings, that have attached garages or in existing dwellings within which
fuel-fired appliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in accordance with Section
R315.1:

Exceptions:

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as the replacement of roofing or
siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or
deck, are exempt from the requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of plumbing or mechanical systems are exempt from
the requirements of this section.

(Reason: Consistent with exceptions in Section R314.3.1)

Section R401.2; amended by adding a new paragraph following the existing paragraph to read as
follows:

Section R401.2. Requirements. (Existing text unchanged)...

Every foundation and/or footing, or any size addition to an existing post-tension foundation,
regulated by this code shall be designed and sealed by a Texas-registered engineer.

(Reason: reflects regional practice.)
Section 602.6.1; amend to read as follows:

R602.6.1 Drilling and notching of top plate. When piping or ductwork is placed in or partly in an
exterior wall or interior load-bearing wall, necessitating cutting, drilling or notching of the top plate
by more than 50 percent of its width, a galvanized metal tie not less than 0.054 inch thick (1.37
mm) (16 Ga) and 5 inches (127 mm) wide shall be fastened across and to the plate at each side
of the opening with not less than eight 10d (0.148 inch diameter) having a minimum length of 1
%% inches (38 mm) at each side or equivalent. Fasteners will be offset to prevent splitting of the
top plate material. The metal tie must extend a minimum of 6 inches past the opening. See figure
R602.6.1. (remainder unchanged)

(Reason: reflects regional practice and to comply with P2603.2.1. Also provides additional assurance
of maintaining the integrity of the framing by spreading the nailing pattern.)

Figure R602.6.1; delete the figure and insert the following figure: corrected drawing lower plate:

Page 4



YALL CONSTRUC TION

EXTERIOR OR BEARING WALL

NOTCH GREATER THAN i<
PERCENT OF THE PLATE VADTH

/ TO ThE PLATE AT FAUH SIDE DF Thi

NOTOHWITS B 10 RS EACHK SIDE

/ / I~ TEGAGE (025400 ) AND 5 IN WD
METAL TIE FASTENED ACROSS AND

3\\"
TOP PLATES

PIPE

For Mt ocs e 29 d e

FIGURE RGO2 61
T0F PLATE FRAMING TO ACCOMMODATE PIPING

(Reason: reflects regional practice and to comply with P2603.2.1. Also provides additional assurance
of maintaining the integrity of the framing by spreading the nailing pattern.)

Insert in IRC Section R602.10.1 as:

Page 5


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22_422_1.png
file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22_422_1.png

1. Alljoints/splices in exterior wall bracing panels using: 3/8" WSP (wood structural panels), 12"
or 25/32" SFB (structural fiberboard), 3/8" or 2" PBS (particle board sheathing) or 7/16" HPS
(hardboard panel siding) shall occur over common framing and be attached using fasteners
and spacing as prescribed by this code.

Section R703.7.4.1; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

In stud framed exterior walls, all ties shall be anchored to studs as follows:

1.

When studs are 16 in (407 mm) o.c., stud ties shall be spaced no further apart than 24
in (737 mm) vertically starting approximately 12 in (381 mm) from the foundation; or

When studs are 24 in (610 mm) o.c., stud ties shall be spaced no further apart than 16
in (483 mm) vertically starting approximately 8 in (254 mm) from the foundation.

(Reason: Provide easy to install and inspect dimensions to clarify how to anchor and to distinguish
"studs" from other types of construction.)

Section R902.1; Amend and add exception #4 to read as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections
R904 and R905. Class A, B, or C roofing shall be installed. (remainder unchanged)

Exceptions:

1. (existing unchanged)
2. (existing unchanged)
3. (existing unchanged)
4

Non-classified roof coverings shall be permitted on one-story detached accessory
structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided
the floor area does not exceed (area defined by jurisdiction).

(Reason: Consistent with regional practice. Language fits better in this section. Aligned the area and
description of the building to be consistent with the item #1 to Section R105.2)

DELETE: Part IV - Energy Conservation - Chapter 11; add text to read as follows:

Energy Conservation/Efficiency to be based on current State of Texas prescribed 2009 IECC
and/or SECO provisions including any future State of Texas required Code advancement.

Section M1305.1.3; amended to read as follows:

M1305.1.3 Appliances in attics. Attics containing appliances requiring access shall be provided...
(bulk of paragraph unchanged)... sides of the appliance where access is required. The clear
access opening dimensions shall be a minimum of 20 inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm),
or larger and large enough to allow removal of the largest appliance. A walkway to appliance shall
be a minimum of % inch floor rated material thickness. As a minimum, access to the attic space
or residential uses shall be provide by one of the following:

1
2
3.
4

A permanent stair.
A pull down stair with a 300 Ib (136 kg).
An access door from an upper floor level.

Access panel may be used in lieu of items 1, 2, or 3 with prior approval of the code
official due to structural conditions.

Page 6



(Reason: To provide a safe means of accessibility to appliances in attics and to allow for different types
of construction limitations.) Consistent with regional amendment to IFGC and IMC 306.3.)

M1307.3- Elevation of Ignition source: Delete the following:

Exception: Elevation of ignition source is not required for appliances that are listed as flammable
vapor resistant.

Section M1411.3; amend to read as follows:

M1411.3 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils or evaporators shall be
conveyed from the drain pan outlet to a sanitary sewer through a trap, by means of a direct or
indirect drain. (remaining text unchanged)

(Reason: Reflects regional practice and to reduce excessive runoff into storm drains.)
Section M1411.3.1; add text to read as follows to #3 and #4:
M1411.3.1 Auxiliary and secondary drain systems. (bulk of paragraph unchanged)
1. (existing unchanged)

2. (existing unchanged)

3. An auxiliary drain pan...(bulk of text unchanged)... with Item 1 of this section. A water
level detection device may be installed only with prior approval of the building official.

4. A water level detection device... (bulk of text unchanged)... overflow rim of such pan.
A water level detection device may be installed only with prior approval of the building
official.

(Reason: Reflects standard practice in this area.)
Section M1411.3.1.1; add text to read as follows:

M1411.3.1.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units ...(bulk of text unchanged)...
installed in the drain line. A water level detection device may be installed only with prior approval
of the building official.

(Reason: Reflects standard practice in this area.)
Section M2005.2; amended to read as follows:

M2005.2 Prohibited locations. Fuel-fired water heaters shall not be installed in a room used as a
storage closet. Water heaters located in a bedroom or bathroom shall be installed in a sealed
enclosure so that combustion air will not be taken from the living space. Access to such enclosure
may be from the bedroom or bathroom when through a solid door, weather-stripped in accordance
with the exterior door air leakage requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code
and equipped with an approved self-closing device. Installation of direct-vent water heaters within
an enclosure is not required.

(Reason: Corresponds with the provisions of IFGC Section 303, exception #5.)
Section G2408.3 (305.5); delete.
(Reason: This provision does not reflect standard practice in this area.)

Section G2415.2.1 (404.2.1); add a second paragraph to read as follows:

Page 7



Both ends of each section of medium pressure gas piping shall identify its operating gas pressure
with an approved tag. The tags are to be composed of aluminum or stainless steel and the
following wording shall be stamped into the tag:

"WARNING

14 to 5 psi gas pressure

Do Not Remove"
(Reason: To protect homeowners and plumbers.)
Section G2415.2.2 (404.2.2); add an exception to read as follows:

Exception: Corrugated stainless steel tubing (CSST) shall be a minimum of 1/2" (18 EDH).

(Reason: Pipe less than %" has a history in this region of causing whistling.)
Section G2415.12 (404.12); amended to read as follows:

G2415.12 (404.12) Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a
minimum depth of 18 inches (457 mm) below grade, except as provided for in Section
G2415.12.1.

(Reason: To provide increased protection to piping systems.)
Section G2415.12.1 (404.12.1); amended to read as follows:

(G2415.12.1 [(404.12.1)] Individual outside appliances. Individual lines to outside lights, grills or
other appliances shall be installed a minimum of 12 inches (203 mm) below finished grade... Rest
unchanged.

(Reason: To provide increased protection to piping systems.)
Section G2417.1 (406.1); amended to read as follows:

G2417.1 (406.1) General. Prior to acceptance and initial operation, all piping installations shall
be inspected and pressure tested to determine that the materials, design, fabrication, and
installation practices comply with the requirements of this code. The permit holder shall make the
applicable tests prescribed in Sections 2417.1.1 through 2417.1.5 to determine compliance with
the provisions of this code. The permit holder shall give reasonable advance notice to the building
official when the piping system is ready for testing. The equipment, material, power and labor
necessary for the inspections and test shall be furnished by the permit holder and the permit
holder shall be responsible for determining that the work will withstand the test pressure
prescribed in the following tests.

(Reason: To utilize language used in the IPC regarding who is responsible for testing procedures.)
Section G2417.4; amended to read as follows:

G2417.4 (406.4) Test pressure measurement. Test pressure shall be measured with a
manometer or with a pressure-measuring device designed and calibrated to read, record, or
indicate a pressure loss caused by leakage during the pressure test period. The source of
pressure shall be isolated before the pressure tests are made. Gauges used to measure...
(remainder unchanged)

(Reason: To require the use of more accurate diaphragm gauges. Spring gauges do not provide
accurate measurement below approximately 17 psig.)

Page 8



Section G2417.4.1; amended to read as follows:

G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be not less than 3 psig (20
kPa gauge), or at the discretion of the Building Official, the piping and valves may be tested at a
pressure of at least 6 inches (152 mm) of mercury, measured with a manometer or slope gauge.
For tests requiring a pressure of 3 psig, gauges shall utilize a dial with a minimum diaphragm
diameter of 32", a set hand, 1/10 pound incrementation and pressure range not to exceed 6 psi
for tests requiring a pressure of 3 psig. For tests requiring a pressure of 10 psig, diaphragm
gauges shall utilize a dial with a minimum diameter of 3 %", a set hand, a minimum of 2/10 pound
incrementation and a pressure range not to exceed 20 psi.

For welded piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of 14 inches water column
pressure (3.48 kPa) (1/2 psi) and less than 200 inches of water column pressure (52.2 kPa) (7.5
psi), the test pressure shall not be less than 10 pounds per square inch (69.6 kPa). For piping
carrying gas at a pressure that exceeds 200 inches of water column (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test
pressure shall be not less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure.

(Reason: To provide for lesser pressures to coordinate with the use of more accurate diaphragm
gauges.)

Section G2417.4.2; amended to read as follows:

G2417.4.2 (406.4.2) Test duration. The test duration shall be held for a length of time satisfactory
to the Building Official, but in no case for less than 5 minutes. For welded piping, and for piping
carrying gas at pressures in excess of 14 inches water column pressure (3.48 kPa), the test
duration shall be held for a length of time satisfactory to the Building Official, but in no case for
less than 30 minutes.

(Reason: To comply with accepted regional practices.)
Section G2420.1 (406.1); add Section G2420.1.4 to read as follows:

G2420.1.4 Valves in CSST installations. Shutoff valves installed with corrugated stainless steel
(CSST) piping systems shall be supported with an approved termination fitting, or equivalent
support, suitable for the size of the valves, of adequate strength and quality, and located at
intervals so as to prevent or damp out excessive vibration but in no case greater than 12 inches
from the center of the valve. Supports shall be installed so as not to interfere with the free
expansion and contraction of the system's piping, fittings, and valves between anchors. All valves
and supports shall be designed and installed so they will not be disengaged by movement of the

supporting piping.

(Reason: To provide proper security to CSST valves. These standards were established in this region
in 1999 when CSST was an emerging technology.)

Section G2420.5.1 (409.5.1); add text to read as follows:

G2420.5.1 (409.5.1) Located within the same room. The shutoff valve ...(bulk of paragraph
unchanged)... in accordance with the appliance manufacturer's instructions. A secondary shutoff
valve must be installed within 3 feet (914 mm) of the firebox if appliance shutoff is located in the
firebox.

(Reason: Reflects regional practice and provides an additional measure of safety.)

Section G2421.1 (410.1); add text and Exception to read as follows:

Page 9



G2421.1 (410.1) Pressure regulators. A line pressure regulator shall be ... (bulk of paragraph
unchanged)... approved for outdoor installation. Access to regulators shall comply with the
requirements for access to appliances as specified in Section M1305.

Exception: A passageway or level service space is not required when the regulator is
capable of being serviced and removed through the required attic opening.

(Reason: To require adequate access to regulators.)
Section G2422.1.2.3 (411.1.3.3); amended to read as follows and delete Exception #1 and #4.

G2422.1.2.3 (410.1) Pressure regulators. A line pressure regulator shall be ...(bulk of paragraph
unchanged)... approved for outdoor installation. Access to regulators shall comply with the
requirements for access to appliances as specified in Section M1305.

Deleted
(existing unchanged)
(existing unchanged)
Deleted

A passageway or level service space is not required when the regulator is accessible
to be serviced and removed through the required attic opening.

S

(Reason: To comply with accepted regional practices.)
Section G2445.2 (621.2); add exception to read as follows:

G2445.2 (621.2) Prohibited use. One or more unvented room heaters shall not be used as the
sole source of comfort heating in a dwelling unit.

Exception: Existing approved unvented room heaters may continue to be used in dwelling
units, in accordance with the code provisions in effect when installed, when approved by the
Building Official unless an unsafe condition is determined to exist as described in
International Fuel Gas Code Section 108.7 of the Fuel Gas Code.

(Reason: Gives code official discretion)
Section G2448.1.1 (624.1.1); amended to read as follows:

G2448.1.1 (624.1.1) Installation requirements. The requirements for water heaters relative to:
access, sizing, relief valves, drain pans and scald protection shall be in accordance with this code.

(Reason: To clarify installation requirements. Also corresponds with amendments regarding water
heater access.)

Section P2801.6; Delete following exception:

Exceptions: Elevation of ignition source is not required for appliances that are listed as flammable
vapor resistant.

(Reason: To coordinate with deleted Exception in Section M1307.3.)
Section P2902.5.3; change to read as follows:

P2902.5.3 Lawn irrigation systems. The potable water supply to lawn irrigation systems shall be
protected against backflow by an atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure-type vacuum
breaker, a double-check assembly or a reduced pressure principle backflow preventer. A valve

Page 10



shall not be installed downstream from an atmospheric vacuum breaker. Where chemicals are
introduced into the system, the potable water supply shall be protected against backflow by a
reduced pressure principle backflow preventer.

(Reason: To provide clarity.)
DELETE-P2903.5- Water hammer
Section P3005.2.6; change to read as follows:

P3005.2.6 Upper Terminal. Each horizontal drain shall be provided with a cleanout at its upper
terminal.

Exception: Cleanouts may be omitted on a horizontal drain less than 5 feet (1524 mm) in
length unless such line is serving sinks or urinals.

(Reason: To eliminate the requirement for excessive cleanouts.)

Section P3111; delete.

(Reason: A combination waste and vent system is not approved for use in residential construction.)
Section P3112.2; delete and replace with the following:

P3112.2 Installation. Traps for island sinks and similar equipment shall be roughed in above the
floor and may be vented by extending the vent as high as possible, but not less than the
drainboard height and then returning it downward and connecting it to the horizontal sink drain
immediately downstream from the vertical fixture drain. The return vent shall be connected to the
horizontal drain through a wye-branch fitting and shall, in addition, be provided with a foot vent
taken off the vertical fixture vent by means of a wye-branch immediately below the floor and
extending to the nearest partition and then through the roof to the open air or may be connected
to other vents at a point not less than six (6) inches (152 mm) above the flood level rim of the
fixtures served. Drainage fittings shall be used on all parts of the vent below the floor level and a
minimum slope of one-quarter (¥4) inch per foot (20.9 mm/m) back to the drain shall be
maintained. The return bend used under the drainboard shall be a one (1) piece fitting or an
assembly of a forty-five (45) degree (0.79 radius), a ninety (90) degree (1.6 radius) and a forty-
five (45) degree (0.79 radius) elbow in the order named. Pipe sizing shall be as elsewhere
required in this Code. The island sink drain, upstream of the return vent, shall serve no other
fixtures. An accessible cleanout shall be installed in the vertical portion of the foot vent.

(Reason: To clarify the installation of island venting and to provide a regional guideline on a standard
installation method for this region.) Part VIIl—-Electrical

Page 11



Page 12


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_15.png

AMERICAN
WOOoD
COUNCIL

March 2012

ADDENDUM
to the 2012 and previous versions of the
Design Values for Wood Construction
{a supplement to the National Design Specification® (NDS®) for Wood Construction)

Effective June 1, 2012, design values for No. 2 Dense and lower grades of visually-graded Southern Pine and No. 2 and
lower grades of visually-graded Mixed Southern Pine lumber, 2"- 4" thick, 2"- 4" wide, will change. The design values
to use with the 2012 NDS, 2005 NDS, and the 2001 NDS are shown below {values that will change on June 1, 2012 are
shown as underdined):

Table 4B Reference Design Values for Visually Graded Southern Pine Dimension Lumber
(2" - 4" thick)"?3*5 (Tabulated design vaiues are for normal load duration and dry service conditions, unless
specified otherwise. See NDS 4.3 for a comprehensive description of design value adjustment factors.)

USE WITH TABLE 4B ADJUSTMENT FACTORS
vahses In inch

Species and Size Tension | Shear | Comp Compres Grading
commercial paraflel | perallel Modulus of Specific | Rules
grade clessification | genging | o grain | to grein to grain to grain E Gravity' | Agency
P F Fy Fo Fe E Eom G

No.2 Dense 1350 50 175 €60 12%0 1500000 | 550.000

No.2 2 -4 wide 1850 8230 175 565 1100 1400000 | 510000 [ o0

No.2 Non-Dense 75 F743 175 480 1050 1.200.000 | 440,000 ’

No.3 and Stud 800 315 175 565 625 | 1.200.000 | sPiB

Construction 200 500 175 565 1150 1.200.000 | 470.000

Standard 4" wide 450 275 178 ses 950 1200000 | 440000 { 055

Utilty 200 125 178 565 625 | 1.100,000 | &

No.2 7 - 4 wide 1.050 650 175 565 1100 1400000 [ 510,080 [~

No.3 and Stud 500 3 | 178 585 _§28 1,200,000 | 440,000 ’

Conatruction 800 500 175 585 1150 1,300,000 | 470,000 SPIB

Stendard 4" wide 450 as 175 55 950 1,200,000 | 440,000 | 0.1

Utility 200 175 5685 g5 1,100,000 | 400,000

1. LUMBER DIMENSIONS. Tabulated design values are appiicable to iumber that will be used under dry conditions such as in most
covered structures. For 2” to 4" thick lumber the DRY dressed sizes shall be used (see Table 1A) regardiess of the moisture content at
the time of manufacture or use. In calculating design vaives, the natural gain in strength and stiffness that occurs as lumber dries has
beentahenimomideraﬁonaswalnmcradueﬁonhsizeMomwlmunaeamdhmbqshﬁnks.mmhhadanying
capadtywetoimreasedsmmmmdsuffmuresunhgfrmdryimmeﬂmnoﬂsehﬂwedesigneﬂedofslzemdtnmaueio
shrinkage.

2. STRESS-RATED BOARDS, information for various grades of Southem Pine stress-rated boards of nominal 17, 1%", and 1%" thickness,
?mwab;v&hoﬁemmmPinlnspodimaumu(SPlB)inﬁwShnduderlgRubsforSouﬂnmPMLumb«.

3. SPRUCE PINE. To obtain recommended design vales for Spruce Pine graded to SPIB nules, multiply the appropriate design values for
Mixed Southem Pine by the comresponding conversion factor shown below and round to the nearest 100,600 psi for E; to the nearest
10.000psﬂorE...:tolhenextbwermuluplcofspsiforﬁandFu;tomenextlomrmuﬁpleofsowfor&. F\, and F. if 1,000 psi or
greater, 25 psi otherwise,

CONVERSION FACTORS FOR DETERMINING DESIGN VALUES FOR SPRUCE PINE

Tension Shesr Comp ik > Modulus
parallel  parallel dicul P of
Bending togrsin 1o grain to grain to grain Elasticity
Fy F Fy Fo Fe EandEy,
ersio 078 0.78 0.88 073 0.78 0.82
Faclor | i i} : i i

4. SIZEFACTOR.Forsizeswidermm12“.usesizefadomforF..F..andF,spedﬁedfaruwu"mm.Use100%ofmeF,,F.:..E.and
Ewn Specified for the 12" width.

5. When individual species or speci gmupsamcomblned.medesignvahestobeusedformecombinationshallbembweatdesign
values for each individual species or species group for each design property.

8.  Spedcific gravity, G, based on weight and volume when oven-dry.

803 Sycolin Road, Suite 201 = Leesburg, VA 20175 = 202 463-2766 * www.awc.org = info@awc.org

Page 13



Page 14


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_16.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEG!SLATIVE FORMAT WOOoD
TABLE 2308.8.5
HEADER AND GIRDER SPANS™: FOR EXTERIOR BEARING WALLS
{Maxi Spans for Douglas Fir-Larch, Hem-Fir, Southern Pine and Spruce-Pine-Fil‘ and Required Number of Jack Studs)
GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)*
30 | 50
st?ff:gg:vsqe SIZE Building width® (Test)
20 28 38 20 28 36
span | NJ" | Span | N3 | span | NJ" | spen | NJ" | span | NJ" | gpan | NJ
2-2x4 3-6 1 3-2 1 2-10 } 32 1 2-9 i 2-6 I
2-2x6 5-5 1 4-8 i 4-2 1 4-8 1 4-1 1 3-8 2
2-2x8 | 6-10 1 5-11 2 54 2 5-11 2 5-2 2 4-7 2
2-2x10 | 8-5 2 7-3 2 6-6 2 7-3 2 6-3 2 5-7 2
2-2x12 | 9-9 2 8-5 2 7-6 2 8-5 2 7-3 2 6-6 2
Roof & Ceiling 3-2x8 8-4 i 7-5 1 6-8 I 7-5 1 6-5 2 5-9 2
3-2x10 j10-6| 1 9-1 2 8-2 2 9-1 2 [7-10} 2 7-0 2
3-2xi2 {12-2) 2 |16-7] 2 9-5 2 10-7| 2 9-2 2 8-2 2
4-2x8 | 9-2 1 8-4 1 7-8 1 8-4 1 7-5 1 6-8 1
4.2x10 {11-8] |} 10-6 | 1 9-5 2 106} 1 9-1 2 8-2 2
4-2x12 | 14-1 1 12-2 2 |10-11} 2 12-2 2 10-7 2 9-5 2
2-2x4 341 1 2-9 i 2-5 1 29 1 2-5 1 2-2 1
2-2x6 | 4-6 1 4-0 1 3-7 2 4-1 1 3-7 2 3-3 2
2-2x8 5-9 2 5-0 2 4-6 2 5-2 2 4-6 2 4-1 2
2-2x10 | 7-0 2 6-2 2 5-6 2 6-4 2 5-6 2 5-0 2
2-2x12 | 8-1 2 7-1 2 6-5 2 7-4 2 6-5 2 59 3
Roof, Ceiling & 1 Center-Bearing Floor | 3-2x8 | 7-2 i 6-3 2 5-8 2 6-5 2 5-8 2 5-1 2
3.2x10 | 8-9 2 7-8 2 6-11 2 7-11 2 6-11 2 6-3 2
32x12 110291 2 (811 2 8-0 2 9.2 2 8-0 2 7-3 2
4-2x8 8-1 1 7-3 | 6-7 1 7-5 1 6-6 { 5-11 2
4-2x10 | 10-1 1 |8-10] 2 8-0 2 9-1 2 8-0 2 7-2 2
4-2x12 {1t-9| 2 |10-3] 2 9-3 2 {10-7] 2 9-3 2 8-4 2
2-2x4 2-8 1 2-4 | 2-1 I 2-7 1 2-3 i 2-0 1
2-2x6 | 3-11 1 3.5 2 3-0 2 (1310 2 3.4 2 3-0 2
2-2x8 5-0 2 4-4 2 3-10 2 4-10 2 4-2 2 3-9 2
2-2x10 | 6-1 2 5-3 2 4-8 2 | 5-11 2 5-1 2 4-7 3
2-2x12 | 7-1 2 6-1 3 5-5 3 l6-10) 2 |s-11 3 5-4 3
Roof. Ceiling & 1 Clear Span ¥loor 3.2x8 | 6-3 2 5-5 2 |4-10] 2 6-1 2 5-3 2 4-8 2
3.2x10 | 7-7 2 6-7 2 |Ss-t1}) 2 7-5 2 6-5 2 5-9 2
3-2x12 | 8-10 2 7-8 2 6-10 2 8-7 2 7-5 2 6-8 2
4-2x8 7-2 t 6-3 2 5-7 2 7-0 1 6-1 2 5-5 2
4.2x10 | 8-9 2 7-7 2 |6-10] 2 8-7 2 7-5 2 6-7 2
4-2x12 1 10-2 2 8-10 2 7-11 2 9-11 2 8-7 2 7-8 2
(continued)

2003, 2008, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 15



Page 16


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_17.png

wWOoQD

TABLE 2308.9.5—continued
HEADER AND GIRDER SPANS*® FOR EXTERIOR BEARING WALLS

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

(Maximum Spans for Douglas Fir-Larch, Hem-Fir, Southern Pine and Spruce-Pine-Fi* and Required Number of Jack Studs)
GROUND SNOW LOAD (psf)*
30 [ 0
HEADERS SUPPORTING SIZE Bullding width® (feet)
28 36 20 28 36
Span | NJ* [ span | NS | Span [ NS | Span | NJ* | Span | NS | Span NJ*
2-2<4 2-7 1 2-3 1 2-0 I 2-6 1 2-2 1 1-11 1
2-2~6 3-9 2 3-3 2 2-11 2 3-8 2 3-2 2 2-10 2
2-2-8 4-9 2 4.2 2 3-9 2 4-7 2 4-0 2 3-8 2
2-2410 5-9 2 5-1 2 4-7 3 5-8 2 4-11 2 4-5 3
- 22412 6-8 2 5-10 3 5-3 3 6-6 2 5-9 3 5-2 3
Aok ( (;“F'ﬁr‘z‘ 2 Center- 3248 [su ] 2 |52 2 |48 2 |50 2 | sa | 2 | a7 2
3-2x10 7-3 2 6-4 2 5-8 2 7-1 2 6-2 2 5-7 2
3-2x12 8-5 2 7-4 2 6-7 2 8-2 2 7-2 2 6-5 3
4-2-8 6-10 ! 6-0 2 5-5 2 6-8 1 5-10 2 5-3 2
4-2=10 8-4 2 7-4 2 6-7 2 3.2 2 7-2 2 6-5 2
4-2x12 9-8 2 8-6 2 7-8 2 9-5 2 8-3 2 7-5 2
2-2-4 2-1 1 1-8 I 1-6 2 2-0 1 1-8 ! 1-5 2
2-2%6 3-1 2 2-8 2 2-4 2 3-0 2 2-7 2 2-3 2
2-2+8 3-10 2 3-4 2 3 3 3-10 2 3-4 2 2-11 3
2-2>10 4-9 2 4-1 3 3-8 3 4-8 2 4-0 3 3-7 3
. . 2-2x%)2 5-6 3 4-9 3 4-3 3 5-5 3 4-8 3 4-2 3
Rool, Ceiling & 2ClearSpan ™35 {410 ] 2 |42 | 2 |39 | 2 |49 ] 2 a1 | 2 |38 2
3-2x10 | 5-1) 2 5-1 2 4-7 3 5-10 2 5-0 2 4-6 3
3.2=12 | 6-10 2 S-11 3 5-4 3 6-9 2 5-10 3 5-3 3
4-2<8 5-7 2 4-10 2 4-4 2 5-6 2 4-9 2 4-3 2
4-2=10 | 6-10 2 5-11 2 5-3 2 6-9 2 5-10 2 5-2 2
4-2%12 | 7-11 2 6-10 2 6-2 3 7-9 2 6-9 2 6-0 3
For SI Iinch = 254 mm 1 foot = 304 8 mm. ! pound per square foot 47 § N/m?

a6 oe

Spans are given in feel and inches (ft-1n)

Tabulated values are for No 2 grade lumber, gxcept No ! or better grade lumber shall by ysgd for Sowthstn Pine Ixd's.

Building width 15 measured perpendicular to the ridge For widths between those shown, spans are permitted 1o be interpolated
NJ - Number of jack studs required to support each end Where the number of required jack studs equals one. the header 1s permatted 1o be supponied by an

approved framing anchor attached to the full-height wall stud and 1o the header

¢ Use 30 pounds per square foot ground snow load for cases in which ground snow load 1s less than 30 pounds per square foot and the roof live Joad 1s cqual 10

or less than 20 pounds per square foot

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*®

Page 17



Page 18


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_18.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

ym-Fir, S

TABLE 2308.9.6
HEADER AND GIRDER SPANS®® FOR INTERIOR BEARING WALLS

)

WOOD

Pine and Spruce-Pine-Fir” and Required Number of Jack Studs)

{Maximum Spans for Douglas Fir-Larch, He

BUILDING width® {feot)
AR e size 20 ) 3%
Span N Span NJ* Span NS
2-2x4 3-i 1 2-8 1 2-5 1
2-2x6 4-6 1 3-11 1 3-6 |
2-2=8 5-9 1 5-0 2 4-5 2
2-2x10) 7-0 2 6-1 2 5-5 2
2-2x12 8-1 2 7-0 2 6-3 2
One Floor Only 3-2x8 72 1 6-3 1 5-7 2
3.2x10 8-9 1 7-7 2 6-9 2
3-2x12 10-2 2 8-10 2 7-10 2
4-2x§ 9-0 1 7-8 1 6-9 i
4.2x10 10-1 1 8-9 1 7-10 2
4-2x12 11-9 1 10-2 2 9-1 2
2-2x4 2-2 ] 1-10 1 1-7 1
2-2%6 3-2 2 2-9 2 2-5 2
2-2%8 4-1 2 3-6 2 3-2 2
2-2<10 4-11 2 4.3 2 3-10 3
2-2x12 5-9 2 5-Q 3 4-5 3
Two Floors 3-2x8 541 2 4-5 2 3-11 2
3-2x10 6-2 2 5-4 2 4-1¢ 2
3-2x12 7-2 2 6-3 2 5-7 3
4.2%8 6-1 i 5-3 2 4-8 2
4-2x10 72 2 6-2 2 5-6 2
4-2x12 8-4 2 7-2 2 6-3 2

For §1 1 mch =254 mm, | foot ~ 304 8 mm
a

Spans are given in feet and inches (fi-in)

o6 o

Tabulated values are for No 2 grade lumber_ex:
Butlding width is measured perpendicular to the ndge For
NJ - Number of jack studs required to suppart each end Where the numl

approved framing anchor attached to the full-height wall stud and to the header

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE"

. for Southern Pine 2x4's
widths between those shown spans are permitied (o be interpolated
ber of required Jack studs equals one. the headers are permit ted to be supported by an

Page 19



Page 20


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_19.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT WwWOOoD
TABLE 2308.10.2(1)
CEILING JOIST SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Uninhabitable Attics Without Storage, Live Load = 10 p ds psf, L/A = 240)
DEAD LOAD = § pounds per square foot
x4 x x x
CEILING(.::::I‘?PACING SPECIES AND GRADE 2 - 2 Gumng ot ’p:" 8 2x10
{R. -in) (ft. - in.) {ft. -in.) (ft. - in.}
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 13-2 20-8 26-0 260
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 12-8 19-11 26-0 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 12-5 19-6 25-8 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 10-10 15-10 20-1 24-6
Hem-Fir RN 12-5 19-6 25-8 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 12-2 19-1 25.2 26-0
Hem-Fir #2 11-7 18-2 24-0 26-0
Hem-Fir #3 10-10 13-10 20-1 24-6
12 [Southem Pine SS 12-11 20-3 26-0 26-0
Southemn Pine #1 12-8 19-11 26-0 26-0
Southem Pine #2 12511-10 19-6 25-8 26-0
[Southem Pine #3 H-69-8 1740 21-8 25-7
ISpruce-Pine-Fir SS 12-2 19-1 25-2 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 11-10 18-8 247 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 11-10 18-8 24-7 '26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 10-10 15-10 20-1 24-6
[Douglas Fir-Larch Ss 11-11 18-9 24-8 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 1i-6 18-1 23-10 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 13 £7-8 23-0 26-0
Pouglas Fir-Larch #3 9-5 13-9 17-5 21-3
) Hem-Fir SS 113 i7-8 23-4 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 11-0 17-4 22-10 26-0
Hem-Fir #2 10-6 16-6 219 26-0
16 Fem-Fir 43 9-5 139 17-5 21-3
[Southem Pine SS 119 18-5 24.3 26-0
Southern Pine #1 11-6 18-1 23-1 26-0
[Southem Pine #2 H-3 109 17-8 23-4 26-0
[Southem Pine #3 106835 149 18-9 22-2
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 11-0 17-4 22-10 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #t 109 16-11 22-4 260
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 10-9 16-11 22-4 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 9-5 139 17-3 21-3
(continued)

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 21



Page 22


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_20.png

WOooD

TABLE 2308.10.2(1
CEILING JOIST SPANS FOR CO

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS ~ LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

tinued
MON LUMBER SPECIES

(Uninhabitable Attics Without Storage, Live Load = 10 pounds psf, L/s = 240)

DEAD LOAD = § pounds per square foot
- x x x o
CEILING(.:&I&:;?PACNG SPECIES AND GRADE x4 o 2 G“"iw e ‘paz"ss 2210
(ft. - in.) {ft. - in.} {ft. - in.) {ft. - in))
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 11-3 17-8 23-3 260
Douglas Fir-larch #1 10-10 17-0 22-5 26-0
iDouglas Fir-Larch #2 10-7 16-7 21-0 25-8
IDouglas Fir-Larch #3 8.7 12-6 15-10 19-3
Hem-Fir SS 10-7 16-8 21-11 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 10-4 16-4 21-6 26-0
Hem-Fir #2 9-11 15-7 20-6 25-3
Hem-Fir #3 8-7 12-6 15-10 19-5
192 Souther Pine Ss 11-0 174 22-10 26-0
Southern Pine #1 10-10 17-0 22-5 26-0
Southem Pine #2 +6-7 10-2 {6-8 21-11 26-0
Southem Pine #3 9478 13-6 17-2 20-3
ISpruce-Pine-Fir S8 10-4 16-4 21-6 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 10-2 15-11 21-0 25-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 10-2 15-11 21-0 25-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 87 12-6 15-10 19-5
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 10-5 16-4 21-7 260
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 10-0 15-9 20-1 24-6
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 9-10 14-10 18-9 22-11
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4
Hem-Fir SS 9-10 15-6 20-5 26-0
[ em-Fir #1 9.8 15-2 19-7 23-11
Hem-Fir #2 9-2 14-5 18-6 22-7
24 Hem-Fir #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4
Southem Pine Ss 10-3 16-1 2i-2 26-0
Southem Pine #1 10-0 15-9 20-10 26-0
Southem Pine #2 948 9-1 15-6 20-1 23-11
Southern Pine #3 8-26-10 120 15-4 18-1
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 9-8 15-2 19-11 25-5
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 9-5 149 18-9 22-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 9-5 14-9 18-9 22-i1
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4

For SI 1inch 254 mm | foot ~ 304 & mm, | pound per square foot = 47 8 N'm '

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Page 23



Page 24


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_21.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT wOoOoD
TABLE 2308.10.2(2)
CEILING JOIST SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
(Uninhabitable Attics With Limited Storage, Live Load = 20 pounds per square foot, L/A = 240)
I DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot
CEOLING(.::?::::PACING SPECIES AND GRADE 2x4 ” 2x Ooem"g o ‘2;.:‘ 2x10
Ift. - in.) (ft - in.) (% - in.) - in)
Douglas Fir-Larch ss 10-5 16-4 217 260
Douglas Fir-Larch 4] 10-0 15-9 20-t 24-6
Douglas Fir-Larch 42 9-10 14-10 189 22-1]
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4
Hem-Fir SS 9-10 15-6 20-5 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 9-8 15-2 19-7 23-11
fiem-Fir #2 9-2 14-5 18-6 22-7
Hem-Fir #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 174
2 [Souther Pine SS 10-3 16-1 212 26-0
Southemn Pine #1 10-0 15-9 20-10 26-0
Southem Pine #2 940 9-1 15-6 20-1 23-11
ISouthem Pine #3 82 6-10 12-0 15-4 18-1
[Spruce-Pine-Fir sS 9-8 15-2 19-11 25-5
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 9-5 149 18-9 22-11
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 9-5 14-9 18-9 22-11
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4
[Douglas Fir-Larch SS 9-6 14-11 19-7 25-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 9-1 13-% 17-5 2143
Douglas Fir-Larch 42 8-9 12-10 16-3 19-10
iDouglas Fir-Larch #3 6-8 9-8 12-4 15-0
Hem-Fir SS 8-11 14-1 186 23-8
Hem-Fir #1 8-9 13-5 16-10 20-8
) [Hem-Fir #2 8-4 12-8 16-0 19-7
16 Hem-Fir #3 6-8 9-8 12-4 15-0
Southemn Pine SS 9-4 14-7 19-3 24-7
Southem Pine #1 9-1 14-4 18-11 23-1
Southem Pine #2 8H 110 13-6 17-5 20-9
[Southem Pine #3 F+5-11 10-5 13-3 15-8
ISpruce-Pine-Fir SS 8-9 13-9 18-1 23-)
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 8.7 12-10 16-3 19-10
ISpruce-Pine-Fir #2 8-7 12-10 16-3 19-10
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 6-8 9-8 12.4 15-0
fcontinued)

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 25



Page 26


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_22.png

WQOD MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT
TABLE 2308.10.2(2)—continued
CEILING JOIST SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Uninhabitable Attics With Limited Storage, Live Load = 20 p ds per square foot, L/a = 240)
DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot
GEILING JOIST SPACING SPECIES AND GRADE 2x4 I 2x8 ] 2x8 | 2x 10
{inches) Maxisnum ceiling joist spans

(tt. - in.) (. -in} (R -in.) (. -in)

Douglas Fir-Larch $S 8-11 14-0 18-5 23-4

Douglas Fir-larch #1 8-7 12-6 15.10 19-5

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 8-0 119 14-10 18-2

Douglas Fir-Larch #3 6-1 8-10 11-3 13-8

Hem-Fir SS 8-5 13-3 17-5 22-3

Hem-Fir #1 8-3 12-3 156 18-11

Hem-Fir #2 7-10 117 14-8 17-10

Hem-Fir #3 6-1 8-10 11-3 13-8

192 [Southem Pine SS 8-9 139 18-1 23-1

Southern Pine #1 8-7 13-6 179 21-1

Southern Pine #2 8572 12-3 15-10 18-11

Southem Pine #3 65 5-5 9-6 12-1 144

Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 83 12-11 17-1 21-8

Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 8-0 11-9 14-10 18-2

Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 8-0 119 14-10 18-2

Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 6-1 8-10 11-3 13-8

IDouglas Fir-Larch SS 8-3 13-0 17-1 20-11

Douglas Fir-Larch #1 7-8 11-2 14-2 17-4

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 7-2 10-6 13-3 16-3

Douglas Fir-Larch #3 5-5 7-1 10-0 12-3

Hem-Fir SS 7-10 12-3 16-2 20-6

Hem-Fir #1 7-6 10-11 13-10 16-11

Hem-Fir #2 7-1 10-4 13-1 16-0

[Hem-Fir #3 5-5 7-11 10-0 12-3

A Southem Pine SS 8-1 §2-9 16-10 21-6
Southern Pine #1 8-0 12-6 15-10 18-10

Southemn Pinc #2 F+8 65 11-0 14-2 16-11
Souther Pine #3 594.10 8-6 i0-10 12-10

Spruce-Pine-Fir S8 7-8 12-0 15-10 19-5

Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 7-2 10-6 13-3 16-3

Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 7-2 10-6 13-3 16-3

Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 5-5 7-1 10-0 12-3

For §1 1inch - 25 4 mm. | foot 304 8 mm. 1 pound per square foot = 478 Nm’

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 27



Page 28


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_23.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT WOOoD

TABLE 2308.10.3(1)
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPEGIES
(Roof Live Load = 20 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Not Attached to Raft L/A = 180}

OEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per sguare foot
il SPECIES AND GRADE 2x4 | 26 | 2%x8 [2x10 [ 2%12 | 2x4 [ 2x6 | 2%x8 [2x10] 2%12
(inches) Maximum rafter spans
(e -iny Jir i)t -ind [ -y [ eft-ing [t <ind | (L -ind | (- In) | (fE - 0} | O - iny)
Douglas Fir-Larch sS 11-6 180 | 239 26-0 26-0 I-6 18-0 23-5 26-0 26-0
Douglas Fir-l.arch #1 -1 174 | 22-5 26-0 26-0 10-6 15-4 19-5 23-9 26-0
Douglas Fir-1 arch 42 10-10 | 16-7 | 21-0 | 25-8 | 260 | 9-10 | 14-4 | 182 | 22-3 | 259
PDouglas Fir-Larch #3 8-7 12-6 | 15-10 19-5 22-6 7-5 10-10 13-9 16-9 19-6
Hem-Fir SS 10-10 17-0 | 22-5 26-0 26-0 10-10 17-0 22-5 26-0 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 10-7 | 16-8 | 2110 | 26-0 | 260 | 10-3 | 14-11 ] 18-11 | 23-2 | 260
N lem-Fir #2 10-1 1511 20-8 | 253 | 260 { 98 | 142 | 17-11 | 21-11 | 25-5
Hem-Fir #3 8-7 126 | 1510 ) 19-5 { 22.6 | 7-5 {1010} 139 | 169 | 19-6
12 Southem Pine sS | 13 [178| 234 | 260 | 260 | 113 | 178 | 234 | 26-0 | 260
Southem Pine #1 111 17-4 | 22-11 | 260 | 26-0 | 1i-1 | 17-3 | 21.9 | 25-10 | 26-0
[Southemn Pine #2 HO-H0-10-2 17-0 | 22-5 26-0 26-0 |Ho-68-9f 15-1 19.5 23-2 26-0
[Southern Pine #3 91718 1 136 17-2 20-3 24-1 |34 6-8] 11-8 14-10 17-6 | 20-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 107 [ 168 ] 21-11 | 26-0 | 260 | 107 | 168 | 21-9 | 26-0 [ 26-0
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 10-4 16-3 | 2i-0 25-8 26-0 9-10 14-4 18-2 22-3 25-9
ISpruce-Pine-Fir #2 104 | 163 21-0 | 25-8 | 26-0 | 9-10 | 14-4 | 18-2 | 223 | 259
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 8-7 126 | 15-10 | 19-5 | 2246 | 7-5 | 10-10 | 13-9 | 169 | 196
[Douglas Fir-Larch SS 10-5 16-4 | 21-7 26-0 26-0 10-5 16-0 20-3 249 26-0
) [Douglas Fir-Larch #1 10-0 15-4 19-5 23-9 26-0 9-1 13-3 16-10 | 20-7 | 23-10
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 9-10 | 14-4 } 182 | 223 | 259 | 86 | 125 | 1599 | 193 | 224
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 7.5 [10-10| 139 | 169 | 196 | 6-5 9-5 | 111 | 126 | 1610
Hem-Fir SS 9-10 {5-6 | 20-5 26-0 26-0 9-10 15-6 19-11 24-4 26-0
[Hem-Fir #1 9-8 14-11 | 18-11 23-2 26-0 8-10 12-11 16-5 20-0 23-3
Hem-Fir #2 9.2 142 | 17-00 [ 2800 | 255 ) 85 | 123 | 156 | 18-11 | 220
Hem-Fir #3 75 {10-10] 139 | 169 | 1946 | 65 9.5 | 111l | 14-6 | 16-10
16 [Southern Pine SS 10-3 16-1 21-2 26-0 26-0 10-3 16-1 21-2 26-0 26-0
[Southem Pine #1 10-0 159 § 20-10 | 25-10 | 26-0 10-0 15-0 18-10 | 2244 26-0
[Southem Pine #2 | 940891 15-1 19-5 23-2 26-0 |947-7} 13-0 16-10 | 20-1 23.7
Southem Pine #3 | 34681 11-8 | 14-10 | 17-6 | 20-11 640590 10-1 | 12-30 | 152 | 181
ISpruce-Pine-Fir SS 9-8 15-2 | 159-11 25-5 26-0 9-8 14-10 | 18-10 | 23-0 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 9-5 14-4 18-2 22-3 25-9 8-6 12-5 159 19-3 22-4
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 9-5 14-4 18-2 22-3 25-9 8-6 12-5 15-9 19-3 224
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 7-5 10-10] 13-9 16-9 19-6 6-5 9-5 -1 14-6 16-10
(contirned}

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 29



Page 30


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_24.png

WOO0D

TABLE 2308.10.3(1)}—continued
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Roof Live Load = 20 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Not Attached to Rafters, L/A = 180)

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
::gm SPECIES AND GRADE Ixa | 2%6 | 2x8 | 2x10 | 212 | 274 | 2%6 | 2x8 [ 2x10 [ 2x12
(inches) Maximum rafter spans
e -in) | (r-in) | (e -in) | GL-in) | (f-in) [t -in) [ -in) [ in) | (R -In) | (R -in)

Douglas Fir-Larch SS| 9.16 | 155 | 20-4 | 25-11 { 26-0 | 9-10 | 147 | 186 | 227 | 260

Douglas Fir-Larch #1] 95 140 | 179 | 218 | 252 8-4 122 | 154 | 189 | 219

Douglas Fir-Larch 42| 811 13-1 167 | 203 | 23-6 7-9 L1-4 144 | 1727 | 204

Douglas Fir-Larch #3| 69 9-11 1227 | 154 | 179 | 5-10 87 | 10-10 | 133 15-5

Hem-Fir ss| 93 14-7 | 192 | 246 | 260 | 9-3 144 | 182 | 223 | 259

Hem-Fir TR N 13-8 | 17-4 | 21-1 24-6 8-1 11-10 | 150 | 184 | 213

Hem-Fir 42| 88 12-11 | 16-4 | 200 | 232 7-8 1n-2 | 142 | o174 | 2041

Hem-Fir 8] 69 9-11 127 1 154 | 179 | 5-10 87 | 10-10 | 13-3 15-5

192 | Southem Pine ss| 98 | 152 | 1911 | 255 | 260 | 98 | 152 | 19-10 | 255 | 26-0
Southern Pine #1195 14-10 | 197 | 237 | 260 93 13-8 | 172 | 205 | 244

Southem Pine 4209380 139 | 179 | 2012 | 24-10 |[846-11f (1-18 | 154 [ 184 | 21-6

Southern Pine #3|72361] 108 | 137 | 160 | 19-1 |6353] 93 119 { 1310 | 166
Spruce-Pine-Fir ss| 91 14-3 | 189 | 23-11 | 260 9-1 137 | 172 | 21-0 | 244
Spruce-Pine-Fir H#1} 810 | 13-l 167 | 203 | 236 7-9 -4 | 144 | 177 | 204
Spruce-Pine-Fir #21] 810 131 167 | 203 | 236 7-9 14 | 144 | 17-7 | 204
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 6-9 9-11 12-7 15-4 17-9 5-10 8-7 10-10 13-3 15-5

Douglas Fir-Larch SS| 91 14-4 | 18-10 | 234 | 26-0 | %-11 13-1 167 | 20-3 | 23-5

Douglas Fir-Larch 81| 87 126 | 15-10 { 195 | 22-6 7-5 10-10 | 139 | 169 19-6

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 8-0 -9 14-10 18-2 21-0 6-11 10-2 12-10¢ 15-8 18-3

Douglas Fir-Larch #3| 6.1 810 | 11-3 | 138 [ 15-n1 5.3 7-8 9.9 | 11-10 | 139

Hem-Fir SS 8-7 13-6 17-10 22-9 26-0 8-7 12-10 16-3 19-10 23-0

Hem-Fir #1184 12-3 15-6 | 18-1t | 21-11 7-3 10-7 13-5 | 16-4 19-0

Hem-Fir #2| 7-1 17 | 148 | 17-10 | 209 | 6-10 | 10-0 | 12-8 | 156 | 17-11

Hem-Fir #31 61 810 | 113 | 138 [ 15-1 5-3 7-8 9.9 | 11-10 | 13.9

s Southem Pinc SS| 8-11 14-1 18-6 238 26-0 8-11 14-1 18-6 22-11 26-0
Southern Pine #1189 139 | 179 | 211 | 252 83 12-3 154 | 183 | 219

Southem Pine #28327-2] 12-3 15-10 § 18-1} 222 | +56-21 10-8 139 16-5 19-3

Southem Pinc 43|655-5| 96 12-1 14-4 | 17-1 |574-8| 83 10-6 | 125 14-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 8-5 13-3 17-5 21-8 25-2 8-4 12-2 15-4 18-9 21-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir 41| 80 119 | 14-10 | 182 | 21-0 | 6-11 10-2 | 12-10 | 15-8 18-3
Spruce-Pine-Fir 42| 80 11-9 | 14410 | 182 | 21-0 | 6-11 102 | 12-10 | 15-8 18-3
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 6-1 8-10 11-3 13-8 15-11 5-3 7-8 9-9 ti-10 13-9

For S1 1 mch =254 mm, 1 foot

304 8 mm. | pound per square foot ~ 479 Nim’

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Page 31



Page 32


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_25.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(2
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
(Roof Live Load = 20 pounds per square foot, Celling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)

WOooD

2003, 2008, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per squars foot
s'!::cﬁ% SPECIES AND GRADE 2x4 | 2%6 | 2x8 | 2x10 [ 2%12 | 24 | 2%6 | 2x8 | 2%%0 | 2x12
{inches) Maximum rafter spans
Me-in) [ -in) | -in) [ -in) [ (R oin) | ot -ing [ v -ing [t -ing [t -ing | (k- iny
Douglas Fir-Larch SS{ 10-5 16-4 21-7 26-0 26-0 10-5 16-4 217 26-0 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #1| 100 15-9 | 20-10 | 26-0 | 26-0 | 10-0 15-4 19-5 | 23.9 | 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #21 9-10 15-6 20-5 25-8 26-0 9-10 14-4 18-2 22-3 25-9
Douglas Fir-Larch #3| 87 126 | 15-10 | 19-5 | 22-6 7.5 10-10 | 139 | 16-9 19-6
Hem-Fir SS| 9-10 i5-6 20-5 26-0 26-0 9-10 15-6 20-5 26-0 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 9-8 15-2 19-11 25-5 26-0 9-8 14-11 18-11 23-2 26-0
Hem-Fir #2 92 t4-5 19-0 24-3 26-0 9-2 14-2 1701 | 21-11 25-5
Hem-Fir #3| 87 126 | 1510 | 19-3 | 22-6 7-5 10-10 | 13.9 16-9 196
12 Southem Pine sS| 103 | 161 | 212 | 260 | 260 { 103 | 161 | 212 | 260 | 260
Southem Pine #1 10-0 15-9 20-10 26-0 26-0 10-0 15-9 20-10 | 25-10 260
Southem Pine #2 (940 95| 15-6 20-5 26-0 26-0 |9-468-9] 15-1 19-5 23-2 26-0
Southem Pine #319-37-8| 136 17-2 20-3 24-1 [F-4+6-8] 1I-8 14-10 17-6 20-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS| 9-8 15-2 19-11 25-5 26-0 9-8 15-2 19-11 25-5 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir # 9-5 149 196 | 24-10 | 26-0 9-5 14-4 182 | 223 | 259
Spruce-Pine-Fir #21 9.5 14-9 19-6 24-10 26-0 9-5 14-4 18-2 22-3 259
Spruce-Pine-Fir 43| 8.7 126 | 15-10 | 195 | 22-6 7-5 10-10 | 13-9 | 169 19-6
Douglas Fir-Larch SS| 96 14-11 19-7 25-0 26-0 9-6 i4-11 19-7 24-9 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 9-1 t4-4 18-11 239 26-0 9.1 13-3 16-10 20-7 23-10
Douglas Fir-Larch #21 8-11 14-) 18-2 22-3 25-9 8-6 12-5 159 19-3 22-4
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 7-5 10-10 13-9 16-9 19-6 6-5 9-5 1111 14-6 16-10
Hem-Fir SS1 8-t 14-) 18-6 23-8 26-0 8-11 14-1 18-6 23-8 26-0
Hem-Fir #11 89 | 439 | 181 | 231 | 260 | 89 | 1211 | 165 | 200 | 233
Hem-Fir #2| 84 13- 17-3 | 21-11 | 25-5 8-4 12-3 15-6 | 18-11 | 220
Hem-Fir #3] 7-5 10-10 13-9 16-9 19-6 6-5 9-5 L1kl 14-6 16-10
e Southern Pine SS| 94 14-7 193 | 247 | 260 9-4 14-7 193 | 24-7 | 260
Southem Pine #1 9-1 14-4 18-11 24-1 26-0 9-1 14-4 £8-10 22-4 26-0
Southern Pine #2 18H-8-7| 14-1 18-6 232 26-0 |8+ 7-7] (30 16-10 20-1 23-7
Southern Pine #3 |24 6.8 11-8 | 14-10 | 17-6 | 20-11 |60 59 10-1 | 12-10 | 152 18-1
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS| 89 13-9 18-1 23-1 26-0 8-9 139 18-1 23-0 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 8-7 13-5 17-9 22-3 259 8-6 12-5 15-9 19-3 22-4
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2] 87 13-5 1729 | 223 | 259 86 12-5 15-9 19-3 224
Spruce-Pine-Fir 43 7-5 10-10 139 16-9 19-6 6-5 9-5 11-1} 14-6 16-10
{continued)

Page 33



Page 34


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_26.png

wOoOoD

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS ~ LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3{2)—continued
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
(Roof Live Load = 20 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)

DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
RAFTER Zxa | 26 | 2%8 | 2%10 | 2x12 | 2x4 | 2x8 | 2x8 | 2x10 | 2x12
s;mﬁn.r:? SPECIES AND GRADE e ————

. -in) | (t-in) | (-in) | - im) [ (f-ing [ (f-ing [t -in) | (R-in) [ (R -ing | (- in)

[Douglas Fir-Larch SS 8-11 14-0 18-5 23-7 26-0 8-11 14-0 18-5 22-7 26-0
Douglas Fir-Larch # 8-7 i3-6 | 17-9 | 218 | 252 | 84 | 122 | 154 | 189 | 219
Douglas Fir-Larch 42 8-5 131 | tee7 | 203§ 236 | 79 | 114 | 144 | 177 | 204
Douglas Fir-Larch # | 69 | 941 | 127 | 154 | t7:9 | 510 | 87 | 1010 | 133 | 155
{em-Fir SS | 85 | 133 | 175 | 223 | 260 | 85 | 133 | 175 | 223 | 259
Hem-Fir #1 8-3 i2-t1 t7-1 23-1 24-6 8-1 11-10 15-0 18-4 213
Hem-Fir #2 7-t0 12-4 16-3 20-0 23.2 7-8 -2 14-2 17-4 20-1
Hem-Fir #3 6-9 9-11 12-7 15-4 17-9 5-10 8-7 10-10 13-3 15-5

192 Kouthern Pine SS | 89 | 130 | 181 | 231 | 260 | 89 | 139 | 181 | 2321 | 26:0
Southern Pine #1 8-7 13-6 17-9 22-8 26-0 8-7 13-6 17-2 20-5 24-4
[Southern Pine ¥2 | 8580 133 17-5 212 24.10 |8-46-11] 11-11 15-4 18-4 21-6
[Southern Pine #3 F36-11 10-8 13-7 16-0 19-1 | 6-35-3 9-3 119 13-10 16-6
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 8-3 12-11 17-1 21-9 26-0 8-3 12-11 17-1 21-0 24-4
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 8-1 12-8 16-7 20-3 23-6 7-9 if-4 14-4 17-7 20-4
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 8-1 12-8 16-7 20-3 23-6 7-9 114 14-4 17-7 20-4
ISpruce-Pine-Fir #3 69 9-i1 12-7 15-4 17-9 5-1¢ 8-7 10-10 13-3 15-5
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 8-3 13-0 172 21-10 260 8-3 13-0 16-7 20-3 23-5
Douglas Fir-Larch # 8-0 12-6 15-10 19-5 226 7-5 10-10 13-9 169 19-6
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 7-10 I-9 14-10 18-2 210 6-11 10-2 12-10 I5-8 {8-3
[Douglas Fir-Larch #3 6-1 8-10 113 13-8 15-11 5-3 7-8 9-9 11-10 13-9
Hem-Fir SS 7-10 12-3 16-2 20-8 25-1 7-10 12-3 16-2 19-10 23-0
Hem-Fir #1 7-8 12-0 15-6 18-11 21-11 7-3 10-7 13-5 16-4 19-0
Hem-Fir 42 7-3 11-5 14-8 17-10 209 6-10 10-0 12-8 15-6 17-11
Hem-Fir #3 6-] 8-10 11-3 13-8 15-11 5-3 7-8 9-9 11-10 13-9

H [Southern Pine SS 8-1 12-9 16-10 21-6 26-0 8-1 12-9 16-10 21-6 26-0
Southern Pine #1 8-0 12-6 16-6 21-1 25-2 8-0 12-3 15-4 18-3 219
Southern Pine #2 |30 T2 123 15-10 18-11 22-2 | 2-56-2| 10-8 13-9 16-5 19-3
Southern Pine #3 6555 9-6 12-1 14-4 17-1 | 8-F4-8 8-3 i0-6 12-5 14-9
[Spruce-Pine-Fir Ss 7-8 12-0 15-10 20-2 24-7 7-8 12-0 1544 189 21.9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 7-6 119 14-10 18-2 21-0 6-11 10-2 12-10 15-8 18-3
Spruce-Pine-Fir H2 7-6 119 14-10 18-2 21-0 6-11 10-2 12-10 15-8 18.3
Spruce-Pine-Fir 43 6-1 8-10 11-3 13-8 15-01 53 7-8 9-9 11-10 139

ForS1 1inch - 254 mm. { foot

304 8 mm. | pound per square foot = 47 9 N'm’

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 35



Page 36


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_27.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(3)

RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Ground Snow Load = 30 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Not Attached to Rafters, L/A = 180)

WOOoD

| DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per sgquare foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
i SPECIES AND GRADE 24 | 2x8 | 2x8 [ 2x10 [ 2x12 [ 2%4 | 2x6 | 2%8 | 2%10 | 2x12
(inches) Maximum rafter spans :
i) | -in) [y T ina [t | ot -in) [er o) ] (e i) | (. -in) | (. -in)
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 10-0 15-9 20-% 26-0 26-0 10-0 15-9 20-1 246 26-0
Dougtas Fir-Larch #1 9-8 14-9 | 188 | 229 | 260 9-0 132 | 168 | 204 | 23-7
Douglas Fir-Larch 42 9.5 139 | 175 | 214 | 248 8-5 124 | 157 19-1 22-1
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 7-1 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8 6-4 9-4 119 14-5 16-8
Hem-Fir SS 96 | 1410 | 19-7 | 250 | 26-0 9.6 14-10 | 19-7 | 244 26-0
Hem-Fir #1 9.3 144 | 182 | 222 | 259 89 | 12-104 163 | 192106 | 230
Hem-Fir #2 | 810 | 137 | 172 ] 2100 | 244 84 | 122 | 154 | 189 | 219
Hem-Fir #3 7-1 10-5 132 16-1 18-8 6-4 9-4 119 | 14-5 16-8
12 Southem Pine SS | 910 | 156 | 205 | 26-0 | 260 | 910 | 156 | 20-5 | 260 | 260
Southem Pine #1 9.8 15-2 | 200 | 249 | 26-0 9-8 | 1410 | 188 | 222 [ 260
[Southern Pine 42 196835 | 14-5 18-8 22-3 26-0 | 9-07-6 { 12-11 16-8 19-11 23-4
[Southem Pine #3 [7364| 112 | 143 | 16-10 | 200 | 6958 | 100 | 129 | 151 | 17-1}
[Spruce-Pine-Fir Ss 9-3 14-7 19-2 24-6 26-0 9-3 14-7 18-8 22-9 26-0
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 9-1 139 | 17-5 | 214 | 248 8-5 124 | 157 | 19 22.1
KSpruce-Pine-Fir #2 .1 139 | 175 | 214 | 248 8-5 12-4 | 157 19-1 22-1
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 7-1 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8 6-4 9-4 119 14-5 16-8
iDouglas Fir-Larch Ss 91 14-4 18-10 23-9 260 9-1 13-9 17-5 213 24-8
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 8-9 12-9 16-2 19-9 22-10 7-10 11-5 14-5 17-8 20-5
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 82 -1t | 1541 18-5 | 21.5 7-3 10-8 | 136 | 166 | 192
[Douglas Fir-Larch #3 6-2 9-0 11-5 13-11 16-2 5-6 8-1 10-3 12-6. 14-6
Hem-Fir ss 8-7 13-6  17-10 | 229 | 260 8-7 136 | 171 | 20-10 | 2422
Hem-Fir #1 8-5 12-5 159 | 193 | 223 7.7 Ll | 1441 17-2 | 19-11
{em-Fir #2 8-0 19 | 1411 | 182 | 21-1 72 10-6 | 13-4 163 | 18-10
Hem-Fir #3 6-2 9.0 H-5 1311 ] 162 5-6 8-1 10-3 12:6 14-6
16 Kouthem Pine SS | 811 14-1 186 | 238 | 260 811 14-1 | 18-6 | 23-8 | 260
Southem Pine #1 8.9 13-9 18-1 | 215 | 257 3-8 12-10 | 162 192 | 22-10
Southem Pine #2 | &77-3| 126 162 | 193 | 22-7 |7486-6] 112 | 14.5 17-3. | 20-2
Southem Pine #3 6356 98 124 | 147 | 174 {5304-11] 88 10 | 130 | 156
Spruce-Pine-Fir $s 85 13-3 17.5 | 22-1 25-7 85 129 | 162 | 199 | 22-10
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 82 | 1111 | 1541 18-5 | 215 7-3 10-8 | 136 | 166 19-2
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 8-2 (NI RN 185 | 21-5 7-3 10-8 | 136 | 166 192
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 6-2 9.0 15 | 13-11 ] te6-2 5-6 8-1 10-3 126 | 14-6
(continued)

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Page 37



Page 38


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_28.png

WwOoD

RAFTER SPANS FOR COM

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(3)—continued
N LUMBER SPECIES
{Ground Snow Load = 30 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Not Attached to Rafters, L/A = 180)

DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
SPACING SPECIES AND GRADE Zo4 | 2+ | 28 [ 2x10 [ ze12 | 274 | 2x6 | 2+8 [ 2xt0 ] 2xw2
({inches) Maximum rafter spans
Pe-iny | -in) |t -ing | o -ing | o -ing [t -ing [t -ind | (R -in) | (R -in) | (R -in)
Dougtas Fir-Larch s | 87 1 136 | 179 | 218 | 252 | 87 | 126 | 1510 | 195 | 22-6
Douglas Fir-Larch st | 70 | 1 | a9 | 1g0 {20em0 ) 70 | 105 | 132 | 161 | 188
Douglas Fir-Larch w2 | 75 || 139 [ 160 196 | 68 | 99 | 124 | 151 | 176
Douglas Fir-Larch w3 | 57 1 83 | 105 | 129 | 149 | 50 | 74 | 94 | 05| 132
Hem-Fir ss | &1 | 129 | 169 | 214 | 248 | 81 | 124 | 157 | 191 | 224
Hem-Fir a1 | 79 | nna | yaa | 177 | 204 | 611 | 102 | 120} 158 | 082
Hem-Fir w2 | 7.4 | 109 [ 137 | 167 193 | 67 | 97 | 122 | 1410 | 173
cm-Fir 3 | 57 ] 83 | tos | 1290 [ as | s0 | 74 | 94 | s foa32
192 Southem Pine ss | 85 | 133 [ 175 | 223 | 260 | 85 | 133 | 175 | 220 | 259
Southern Pine a1 | 83 | 130 166 | 197 | 234 | 710 | 10 | 149 | 476 | 20-14
Souther Pine ¥ e8| 115 | 149 | 177 | 2007|7460 102 | 132 | 159 | 185
Southem Pine 93 |e0s0| 810 | 113 | 134 | 1500 |s446] 701 | 1041 | 0111 | 142
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 1 701 | 125 | 165 | 202 | 234 | 711 | t1-8 | 149 | 180 | 20-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir st | 75 J1onn | 139 | 1610 196 | 68 | 99 | 1244 | 151 | 176
Spruce-Pine-Fir 42 0 7.5 ro-nn | 139 [ 1610 | 196 | 68 | 99 | 124 | 151 | 176
Spruce-Pine-Fir 30 s7 1 83 | 1wos | 129 | a9 | 50 | 74 | 94 | 15| 132
Douglas Fir-larch SS T 701 | 126 | 15-16 | 195 | 226 | 78 | 13 | 1a2 | 174 | 2041
Douglas Fir-Larch v b Pros | 2| teel | 188 1 64 | 94 | 119 | 145 | 168
Douglas Fir-Larch 2 | 68 | 99 | 124 | 15 | 176 | s | 88 | 110 | 136 | 157
Douglas Fir-Lasch #3 | 50 | 74 | 94 [ 115 | 132 a6 | 67 | 84 | 102 | 11-10
Hem-Fir Ss | 76 1110 | 157 | 191 | 221 | 76 | 110 [ 1311 ] 17-0 | 199
Hem-Fir gt | 611 | 102 [ 1200 ] 158 | 182} ez | 91 | 116 | 140 [ 163
iHem-Fir w2 | 67 | 97 | 122 | 10| 173} sa0 | 87 [ 1010 | 133 | 188
IHem-Fir 93 | 50 | 74 | 94 | s | 32| 46 | 67 | 84 | 102 1 110
24 Souther Pine SS | 710 | 133 | iez | 208 | 251 | 710 | 123 | 162 | 198 | 23-0
Southern Pine g1 ] 728 | el ae | 176 J 2000 | 71 | 106 | 132 | 158 | 188
Southem Pine #2 |72460) 102 | 132 | 159 | 18-5 |e45-4) 92 | 119 | 141 | 166
Southem Pine ¥ |saa6! 7010 | 100 | ain | 142 [494:0] 71 | 90 | 108 | 128
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS | 744 | 117 | 149 | 180 | 20-11 | 71 | 10-5 | 132 | 161 | 188
Spruce-Pine-Fir g1 | 68 | 99 | 1224 | 150 | 176 | s | 88 | 110 | 136 | 157
Spruce-Pine-Fir 42 | 68 | 09 | 124 | 154 | 176 | st | 88 | 110 ] 136 | 157
pruce-Pine-Fir a3 | 50 | 74 } 94 | us | 132 46 | 67 | 8a | 102 | 1-i0

ForSI Tinch 254 mm. ! fool ~ 304 8 mm. | pound per square fool = 479 Nim’

2003, 2006, 2008, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Page 39



Page 40


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_29.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(4
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Ground Snow Load = 50 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Not Attached to Rafters, L/A = 180)

wooD

f DEAD LOAD # 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
- in) [ (ot <in) [ - in) [ (- in) | (- in) | O -in) | (R~ in) | (/- in) | (fC - im) | CFE - i)
Douglas Fir-Larch SS | 85 | 13-3 | 176 | 224 | 260 | 85 | 133 | 170 | 209 | 24-10
Dougls Fir-Larch #1082 |20 | 153 | g7 | 207 | 77 | 2 | w4 | 173 | 200
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 | 78 s | 1a3 | s {202 | 70 | ros | 32 | 161 | 188
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 [ 510 | 86 [ 1090 | 132 | 153 | 55 | 720 | 100 | 122 | 144
Hem-Fir SS | 80 | 126 | 166 | 211 | 256 | 80 | 126 | t6s | 204 | 237
Hem-Fir #t | 710 | 109 [ a0 18 | 210 | 75 | 10i0] 139 | 169 | 195
Hem-Fir #2 | 75 | vt | o | az2 [0 70 | 103 | 13-0 L aseo ] 18es
Mem-Fir #3 | 510 ] 86 [ 109 | 132 | 1531 55 | 700 | 100 | 122 | 1441
12 Kouthem Pine ss | 84 | 130 | 172 [21-11 ] 260 | 84 | 130 | 172 | 20-11 | 260
Southern Pine #1 | 82 | 1210 [ 1610 | 203 | 241 | 82 | 126 | 159 | 18.9 | 224
Southern Pine #2 [80610 119 | 153 | 182 | 213 |2264] 10-01 | 141 | 16210 | 199
KSouthem Pine #3 |eas2| 92 | 1.8 | 139 | 164 59410 85 | 109 | 129 | 152
KSpruce-Pinc-Fir SS | 7-10 | 123 | 162 | 208 | 241 | 710 | 123 | 159 | 193 | 224
Spruce-Pine-Fir st | 78 | s | s | ars {202 7 | ros | 32| 161 | 188
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 | 78 1 13 a3 s 202 0 70 | res | 32 ] 16 | 188
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 1 510 86 | 109 [ 132 [ 153 | 55 | 7:10 | 100 | 122 | 141
Douglas Fir-Larch SS | 78 | 121 | 1510 | 195 | 226 | 7-8 | 117 | 148 | 17-11 ] 20-10
Douglas Fir-Larch # | 70 fros | 12 | vet |18 | 67 | 98 | 122 | 14 | 173
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 | 68 | 99 | 124 [ 150 | 176 | 62 | 90 | 115 | 1311 | 162
Dauglas Fir-Larch # L 50 | 4 | oa | s | 32| 48 | 610 | 88 | 1006 | 123
flem-Fir §S | 73 | 115 | 150 | 190 | 32t | 73 | 115 | 145 | 178 | 205
Hem-Fir #t {61t ] 102 [ 1210 ) 158 | 182 | 65 | 9.5 | 1111 ] 126 | 1600
iHem-Fir 82 1 67 | 97 | 122 [ a0 173 | 61 | 81 | 113 | 139 | 151
Hem-Fir #3 | 50 | 74 | 94 | 115 | 132 | 48 | 610 | 88 | 106 | 123
16 |Southem Pinc SS | 76 | 11-10 | 157 | 19:11 | 243 | 76 | 1110 | 157 | 19211 | 23-10
Southem Pine #1 ] 75 | 07 | 149 | 176 [ 2001 | 74 | w010 | 138 | 162 | 194
[Southern Pine 92 |3460] 102 | 132 | 159 | 18-5 le756| 95 | 122 | 187 | 1741
[Southem Pine #3 5446 700 | 101 | -t | 142 [mrad] 74 | 94 | 10 | o13a1
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS | 71 | 11-2 | 148 | 180 | 20-41 | 7.1 | 109 | 138 | 168 | 193
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1068 | 99 | 124 | 151 | 176 | 62 | 90 | 115 | 1311 | 162
Spruce-Pine-Fir 92 | 68 | 99 | 124 | 151 | 176 | 62 | 90 | 115 | 1311 | 162
ISpruce-Pinc-Fir #3 | 50 | 74 | 94 | 115 | 132 | 48 | 610 | 88 | 10-6 | 123
(continued)

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

Page 41



Page 42


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_30.png

wooD

TABLE 2308.10.3(4)—continued

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES

(Ground $now Load = 50 pounds per square foot, Celling Not Attached to Rafters, L/A = 180}
DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per sguare foot
RarTER SPECIES AND GRADE 2x4 | 276 | 2%8 | 2x10 | 2x12 | 2%4 | 2>6 | 2x8 ] 2x10 | 2x42
(inches) Maximum rafter spans
@t -in) (R -ing{ 4R -in) | (R -in) | (- in) | it - i) | (it - in) | (R - in) | (-in) | (ft.-in)

Douglas Fir-Larch SS 7-3 114 | 146 17-8 | 20-6 7-3 10-7 13-5 16-3 19-0

Douglas Fir-Larch #1 6-6 9-6 12-0 14-8 17-1 6-0 8-10 12 13-7 15-9

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 6-1 811 | 113 13-9 | 15-11 5-7 8-3 10-5 12-9 14.9

Douglas Fir-Larch #3 4-7 6-9 8-6 10-§ 1241 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 11-2
[Hem-Fir SS 6-10 10-:9 | 14-2 17.5 | 20-2 | 6-10 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8

Hem-Fir # 6-4 9-3 11-9 14-4 16-7 | 5-10 8-7 10-10 § 13-3 15-3

Hem-Fir #2 6-0 8-9 -1 13-7 15-9 5-7 8-1 10-3 12-7 14-7

Hem-Fir #3 4-7 6-9 8-6 10-5 12-1 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 1.2

19.2 Southem Pine SS 7-1 11-2 | 14-8 18-9 | 22-i0 7-1 11-2 14-8 187 | 219
Southemn Pine #1 7-0 10-8 | 13-5 16-0 | 19-1 6-8 9-11 12-5 | 14-10 | 17-8

Southem Pine #2 6635-5| 94 12-0 14-4 ] 16-10 |6-85-0| B8-8 i1-2 13-4 15-7

iSouthern Pine #3 |44l 73 9-2 10-10 | 12-11 [4-6 3-10| 6-8 8-6 t0-1 120
ISpruce-Pine-Fir sS 6-8 10-6 | 13-5 i6-5 | 19-1 6-8 9-10 12-5 15-3 17-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 6-1 811 113 13-9 | I5-11 5-7 8-3 10-5 129 14-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 6-1 8111 113 139 | 1511 3-7 8-3 10-5 12-9 14-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 4-7 6-9 8-6 f0-5 | 12-1 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 11-2

Douglas Fir-Larch Ss 6-8 10-3 | 130 | 15-10 ] 184 6-6 9-6 12-0 14-8 17-0

Douglas Fir-Larch #1 3-10 8-6 i0-9 13-2 15-3 5-5 7-10 10-0 12-2 14-1

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 5-5 711 | 10-1 124 14-3 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2

Douglas Fir-Larch #3 4-1 6-0 7-7 9-4 109 | 3-10 5-7 7-1 8.7 10-0

Hem-Fir SS 6-4 9-11 1 12-9 15-7 18-0 6-4 9-4 11-9 14-5 16-8

Hem-Fir #1 5-8 83 10-6 | 12-10 { 14-10 | 5-3 7-8 9-9 1-10 | 13-9

Hem-Fir #2 5-4 7-104 9-11 12-1 14-1 4-11 7-3 9-2 11-3 13-0

Hem-Fir #3 4-1 6-0 7-7 9-4 109 | 3-10 5-7 7-1 8-7 10-0

2 Southemn Pine SS 6-7 10-4 | 13-8 17-5 | 210 6-7 10-4 13-8 16-7 19-3
Southemn Pine #1 6-5 9-7 12-0 14-4 17-1 6-0 8-10 11-2 i3-3 15-9

Southern Pine #2 |[5494-10| 8-4 10-9 | 12-10 | 15-1 {35461 79 100 | 11-11 | 13-1i
Southem Ping¢ #3 |-443-8| 65 8-3 9-9 11-7 [443-5; 6-0 7-7 9-0 10-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 6-2 9-6 12.0 14-8 17-1 6-0 8-10 -2 137 15-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 3-5 7-11 ] 10-1 12-4 14-3 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-3 13-2
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 5-5 7-11 | 10-1 12-4 143 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 4-1 6-0 7-7 9-4 109 | 3-10 5-7 7-1 8-7 10-0

For Si 1 nch =254 mm, | foot - 304 8 mm. | pound per square foot -~ 479 Nm®

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 43



Page 44


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_31.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(5}
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
(Ground Snow Load = 30 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)

WOO0D

f DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
RAFTER 2x4 2x6 2x=8 2%t 2x1 x4 x 2x8 x1 2%12
s(;.Ac:'::? SPECIES AND GRADE I l ] : Luimu:x nﬂ:f lpll‘l 2t l l 22 l

(ft-in} { (ft-in) | (R-in) | (R -in) | (. -in) | (h-in) [(ft-in)]| (R -in) | (f.-in) | (. -in)
Douglas Fir-Larch sS 9-1 | 144 | 1810 | 241 | 260 | 9-1 | 144 | 1810 | 241 | 2620
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 89 | 139 | 182 | 2299 | 26.0 | 89 | 132 | 168 | 204 | 237
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 87 | 136 | 175 | 21-4 | 24-8 | 85 | 124 | 157 | 199 | 220
Dougles Fir-Larch 43 70| 105 | 132 | 161 | 188 | 64 | 94 | 119 | 145 | 168
Hem-Fir sS 87 | 13-6 | 17-10 | 22-9 | 26-0 | 8-7 | 136 | 17-10 | 229 | 260
Hem-Fir #1 85 | 133 | 17-5 | 222 | 259 | 85 [12-10] 163 | 1910 | 230
Hem-Fir ¥ 80 | 127 | 167 | 21.0 | 244 | 80 | 122] 154 | 189 | 219
Hem-Fir #3 710 | 105 | 132 | 161 | 188 | 64 | 94 | 119 | 145 | 168
12 Kouthem Pine ss 811 | 14-1 | 186 | 238 | 26-0 | 811 | 14t | 186 | 23-8 | 260
Souther Pine #1 89 | 139 | 182 | 232 | 260 | 89 | 139 | 182 | 22 | 260
[Southem Pine #2 (8283 136 | 17:10 | 223 | 260 | 8376 | 12-11 ] 168 | 19-11 | 234
Southem Pine #3 |23264) 112 | 143 | te-10 | 200 | 6958 | 100 | 129 | 151 | 17-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 85 | 133 | 175 | 223 | 260 | 85 | 133 | 17-5 | 223 | 260
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 83 121 | 170 | 2144 | 248 | 83 | 124 | 157 | 1990 | 2241
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 83 | 1211 ] 170 | 214 | 248 | &3 | 124 | 157 | 199 | 229
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 71§ 105 | 132 | a6t | 188 | 64 | o4 | 119 | 145 | 168
Douglas Fir-Larch SS 83 | 130 [ 172 [ 210 ] 260 | 83 | 130} 172 | 213 | 248
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 8-0 | 126 | 162 | 199 | 2210 | 710 | 115 | 14-5 | 17-8 | 205
Dougias Fir-Larch # 7-10 ) e | oasar | oises | 215 73 | 108 | 136 | 166 | 192
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 62 | 90 | 115 | 1311 | 162 56 | 81 | 103 | 126 | 146
Hem-Fir SS 7-10 { 123 [ 162 | 208 | 25-1 | 7-10 | 123 | 162 | 208 | 242
Hem-Fir #1 78 | 120 | 159 | 193 | 223 77 | -t | o1 | 172 | oen
Hem-Fir 42 73 | s | taenn | o182 | 214 72 | 1006 | 134 | 163 | 1810
Hem-Fir 43 62 | 90 | 1155 | 1311 | 162 | 56 ] 81 | 103 | 126 | 146
16 outher Pine SS | &1 | 129 | 1600 | 216 | 260 | 81 | 129 ] 1610 | 215 | 260
Southern Pine #1 80 | 126 | 166 | 211 | 257 | 80 | 126 | 162 | 192 | 2210
[Southem Pine #2  |740223| 123 | 162 | 193 | 227 |2466-6] 112 | 145 | 173 | 202
Southem Pine 43 |6256! 98 | 124 | 147 | 174 |5404-11] 88 | 110 | 130 | 156
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 7-8 [ 1220 [ 1510 ] 202 [ 247 | 78 | 120 | 1510 | 199 | 22-10
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 76 | 119 | 151 | 185 | 215 7-3 | 108 | 136 | 166 | 192
ISpruce-Pine-Fir 2 76 | 1.9 | 151 | 185 | 215 7-3 | 108 | 136 | 166 | 192
Spruce-Pine-Fir 3 62 | 90 | 115 fuzar | 162 | 56 | &1 | 103 | 1246 | 146
(continued)

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE"

Page 45



Page 46


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_32.png

wWOoOoD

TABLE 2308.10.3(5)-~continued

MAY 2012 AMENOMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES
{Ground Snow Load =30 p ds per square foot, Ceiling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)
DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
RAFTER 2x4 | 2x6 | 2x8 T"2x10 [ 2x12 | 2x4 [ 2xe | 28 | 2x10 [T2x12
3&?;21()3 SPECIES AND GRADE N rafter spans

(R-in) | (ft.-in) | (f.-in) | (t-in) | (R.-in) (fL-in) | (ft.-in) | ('t -in) | (R.-in) (ft.-in}

Douglas Fir-Larch SS 79 12-3 16-1 20-7 250 79 12-3 15-10 19-5 22-6

Douglas Fir-Larch #1 7-6 11-8 149 18-0 | 20-1] 7-1 10-3 13-2 16-1 18-8

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 7-4 10-11 13-9 16-10 19-6 6-8 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6

Douglas Fir-Larch #3 5-7 8-3 10-3 12-9 14-9 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2

Hem-Fir SS 7-4 17 15-3 19-5 23-7 7-4 -7 15-3 19-1 22-1

Hem-Fir #1 7-2 114 14-4 17-7 20-4 6-11 10-2 12-10 £5-8 18-2

Hem-Fir 42 6-10 10-9 13-7 16-7 19-3 6-7 9-7 12-2 14-10 17-3

Hem-Fir #3 5-7 8-3 10-5 12-9 14-9 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2

192 iSouthermn Pine SS 7-8 12-0 15-10 | 20-2 24-7 7-8 120 15-10 | 20-2 24-7
Southem Pine #1 7-6 11-9 15-6 19-7 23-4 7-6 119 14-9 17-6 20-t1

iSouthern Pine #2 | 7468 11-5 14-9 17-7 20-7 | 2460 1§02 132 15-9 18-5

iSouthern Pine #3 (60501 810 -3 13-4 15-10 | $-44-6| 7-1} 10-1 1=l 14-2
(Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 7-2 11-4 14-11 19-0 23-1 7-2 11-4 14-9 18-0 20-11
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 7-0 10-1) 13-9 16-10 19-6 6-8 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 7-0 10-11 13-9 16-10 19-6 6-8 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6
Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 5-7 8.3 10-5 12-9 14-9 5-0 7-4 9-4 -5 13-2

Douglas Fir-Larch SS 7-3 11-4 15-0 19-1 22-6 7-3 1t-3 14-2 17-4 20-1
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 7-0 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8 6-4 9-4 11-9 14-5 16-8

Douglas Fir-Larch #2 6-8 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 3-11 8-8 11-0 13-6 157
Douglas Fir-Larch 43 5-0 7-4 9-4 113 13-2 4-6 6-7 8-4 10-2 11-10
Hem-Fir SS 6-10 10-9 14-2 18-0 | 21-11 6-10 10-9 13-11 17-0 19-9

Hem-Fir #1 6-8 10-2 12-10 15-8 18-2 6-2 91 -6 14-0 16-3
Hem-Fir #2 6-4 9-7 12.2 14-10 17-3 5-10 8-7 10-10 13-3 15-5
Hem-Fir #3 5-0 7-4 9-4 t1-5 13-2 4-6 6-7 8-4 10-2 11-10

24 ]

Southermn Pine SS 7-1 11-2 14-8 18-9 22-10 7-1 1-2 14-8 18-9 22-10
Southern Pine #1 7-0 10-11 14-5 17-6 20-11 7-0 10-6 13-2 15-8 18-8
Southemn Pine #2 |6-386-0]- 10-2 13-2 15-9 18-5 | 6454 92 11-9 14-1 16-6
Southern Ping H3 | 5446 7-11 10-1 H1-11 142 | 4940 7-1 9-0 10-8 12-8
iSpruce-Pine-Fir S8 6-8 10-6 13-10 17-8 26-11 6-8 10-5 13-2 | 16-1 18-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir #i 6-6 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 5-11 8-8 11-0 13-6 15-7
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 6-6 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 5411 8-8 11-0 13-6 13-7
pruce-Pine-Fir #3 5-0 7-4 9-4 t1-5 13-2 4-6 6-7 8-4 10-2 11-10

For St §wnch 254 mm. | foot

304.8 mm. 1 pound per square foot = 479 N'm’

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

Page 47



Page 48


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_33.png

MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS - LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(6)
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES

WOOD

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE*

{Ground Snow Load = 50 pounds per square foot, Ceiling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)
DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
gﬁmﬁ'}; SPECIES AND GRADE 2%4 | 228 | 2#8 | 2x10 | 2x12 | 2x4 | 2%6 | 2%8 | 2= | 2xm
{inches) Maximum rafier spans
(. -in) [t -in) [ (R -in) [ (M -ind [ -in) | (e -in) | (. -in) | (- 1n) | (R -in) | (R -in)
[Douglas Fir-Larch SS | 78 | 121 | 1501 | 203 | 248 | 7-8 | 121 | 1501 | 203 | 240
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 7-5 11-7 §5-3 18.7 21-7 7-5 11-2 14-1 17-3 20-0
Douglas Fir-Larch 82 73 | 13 | 143 ] 975 ) 202 | 70 o105 o132 | 16l | 188
Douglas Fir-Larch #3 | 510 | 86 | 109 | 132 [ 153 | 55 | 750 | 100 | 122 | 14.1
Hem-Fir sS | 73 | s [ 150 | 192 [ 234 | 73 | 115 | 150 | 192 | 234
Hem-Fir #1 7-1 1-2 14-8 18-1 210 7.1 10-10 13-9 16-9 19-5
Hem-Fir #2 1 69 | 108 | 140 | 172 [ 1911} 69 | 103 | 130 | 1510 ] 185
[Hem-Fir #3 5-10 8-6 10-9 13-2 15-3 5-5 7-10 10-0 12-2 14-1
12 Southem Pine $$ | 76 | 110 | 157 [ 190 | 243 | 76 | nete | 157 [ 101 | 243
Southern Pine #1 7-5 11-7 15-4 19-7 239 75 11-7 15-4 18-9 22-4
[Southem Pine 42 (F36-101 11-5 15-0 18-2 21-3 | 1364 10-11 14-1 16-10 19-9
[Southern Pine #3 | 6-23-2 9-2 11-8 13-9 16-4 13-84-10| 8-5 10-9 12-9 152
ISpruce-Pine-Fir SS 7-1 -2 14-8 18-9 22-10 7-1 112 14-8 18-9 22-4
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 6-11 10-11 i4-3 17-5 20-2 6-11 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8
Spruoc—Pine-Fir #2 6-11 10-11 14-3 17-5 20-2 6-11 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8
Spmce-Pinc-Fir #3 5-10 8-6 10-9 13-2 15-3 5-5 7-10 10-0 12-2 t4-1
[Douglas Fir-Larch SS 7-0 110 14-5 18-5 22-5 7-0 11-0 t4-5 17-11 20-10
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 6-9 10-5 13-2 16-1 18-8 6-7 9-8 12.2 14-11 17-3
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 6-7 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 6-2 9-0 11-5 13-11 16-2
IDouglas Fir-Larch #3 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2 4-8 6-10 8-8 10-6 12-3
Hem-Fir SS 6-7 10-4 13-8 17-5 21-2 6-7 10-4 13-8 17-5 20-5
Hem-Fir @1 | 65 | 102 {1210} 158 | 182 | 65 9-5 | 11-10 | 146 | 16-10
Hem-Fir #2062 | 97 | 122 {40 173 ) 61 | g0} 13 | 139 | 1511
Hem-Fir #3 5-0 7-4 9-4 115 13-2 4-8 6-10 8-8 10-6 12-3
16 [Southern Pine SS 6-10 10-9 14.2 18-1 22-0 6-10 10-9 14-2 18-1 2220
Southern Pine #1 6-9 10-7 13-11 17-6 20-1 6-9 10-7 13-8 16-2 19-4
[Southern Pine #2 | 6376:0] 10-2 13-2 15-9 18-5 | 625-6 9.5 12-2 14-7 17-1
Southem Pine #3 3446 7-1 10-1 b1-11 142 |44+ 421 7-4 9-4 110 13-1
[Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 6-5 10-2 13-4 170 20-9 6-5 §0-2 134 16-8 19-4
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 6-4 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 6-2 9-(} 11-5 13-11 16-2
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 6-4 9-9 12-4 15-1 17-6 6-2 9.0 1-5 13-11 16-2
ISpruce-Pine-Fir #3 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 13-2 4-8 6-10 8.8 10-6 12-3
(contimed)

Page 49



Page 50


file:///C:/Users/wwilliamson/AppData/Local/Microsoft/Windows/Temporary%20Internet%20Files/Content.IE5/images/22-422_34.png

WwWOo0D MAY 2012 AMENDMENTS ~ LEGISLATIVE FORMAT

TABLE 2308.10.3(6)—continued
RAFTER SPANS FOR COMMON LUMBER SPECIES

(Ground Snow Load = 50 pounds per sguare foot, Celling Attached to Rafters, L/A = 240)
DEAD LOAD = 10 pounds per square foot DEAD LOAD = 20 pounds per square foot
RAFTER 2x4 | 2x6 | 2x8 | 2%10 | 2x12 | 2x4 [ 2xe [ 2x8 [ 2x10 | 2x12
s(m:m; SPECIES AND GRADE oS ————

{t-in) | ¢t -in) | (f.-in) | (6 -in) | (-in) | (R -in) | (R-In) | {ft.-In) (- in) | (ft - in)

Douglas Fir-Larch sS 67 | 104 | 137 | 174 | 206 | 67 | 104 ] 135 | 165 | 190
Douglas Fie-Larch #1 6-4 9-6 12-0 14-8 17-1 6-0 8-10 112 13-7 15-9
Douglas Fir-Larch #2 6-1 811 11-3 13-9 15-1t 5-7 8-3 10-5 12-9 14-9
Douglas Fir-Larch 43 4-7 6-9 8-6 10-5 12-1 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 11-2
Hem-Fir SS 6-2 9-9 12-10 16-5 19-11 6-2 9.9 12-10 16-1 i8-8
lem-Fir #i 6-1 93 | 119 | 144 | 167 | 510 | 87 | 1010 | 133 | 155
Hem-Fir 42 5-9 8-9 | 37 o159 | 57 3-1 103 | 1227 | 147
Hem-Fir #3 4-7 6-9 8-6 10-5 12-1 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 112

192 Southem Pine SS 65 | 102 | 134 | 170 | 209 | 65 | 102 | 134 | 170 | 209
Southem Pine #i 6-4 9-11 13-1 160 19-1 6-4 9-11 12-5 14-10 17-8
Souther Pine #2 le255] 94 120 | 144 | 16-10 | 66501 8-8 112 | 134 | 157
Southem Pine 43 latrag] 73 92 | 10-10 | 12-11 [4-63-10] 68 | 86 | 101 | 120
Spruce-Pine-Fir SS 6-1 9.6 | 127 | 160 | 19-1 6-1 9.6 | 12-5 | 153 | 17-8
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 5-11 8-11 11-3 13-9 15-11 5-7 8-3 10-5 12.9 14-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 5-11 8-11 11-3 13-9 15-11 5-7 8-3 10-5 12-9 14-9
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 4-7 6-9 8-6 10-5 12-1 4-3 6-3 7-11 9-7 11-2
IDouglas Fir-Larch SS 6-1 9-7 12-7 15-10 18-4 6-1 9-6 12-0 14-8 17-0
Douglas Fir-Larch #1 510 | 86 | 109 | 132 | 153 | 5.5 | 710 | 100 | 122 | 14-1

/ [Dougtas Fir-Larch #2 5.5 0 7-10 | 10-0 | 12-4 | 143 5-0 74 9.4 n-s | 132
Douglas Fir-Larch 43 41 6-0 7-7 94 | 109 | 3-10 | 57 7-1 8-7 100
Hem-Fir SS 5-9 91 | =it [ 1512 | 180 | 5.9 9-1 N9 | 135 | tes
Hem-Fir #1 5-8 8-3 10-6 12-10 14-10 5-3 7-8 9-9 11-10 13-9
Hem-Fir 42 se4 | 710 | 911 | o121 | 141 | o4an 7-3 9-2 -3 | 130
Hem-Fir #3 4-1 6-0 7-7 9-4 10-9 3-10 5-7 7-1 8-7 10-0

# Southem Pine SS 6-0 9-5 12-5 15-10 19-3 6-0 9.5 12.5 15-10 19-3
Southem Pinc #Y 3-10 9-3 12-0 14-4 1741 5-10 8-10 112 13-3 15-9
[Southem Pine #2  |5-94-10( 84 10-9 12-10 15-1 {355 46] 79 100 11-11 13-11
Southem Pine #3 4-4-3-8] 65 8.3 9.9 -7 |4343-5 6-0 77 9-0 10-8
[Spruce-Pine-Fir S8 5-8 8-10 11-8 14-8 §7-4 5-8 8-10 -2 13-7 15-9
Spruce-Pine-Fir #1 5-3 7-11 10-1 12-4 14.3 5-0 7-4 9-4 14-5 13-2
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #2 5-5 7-1t 10-1 i2-4 14-3 5-0 7-4 9-4 11-5 132
[Spruce-Pine-Fir #3 4-1 6-0 77 9-4 10-9 3-10 5-7 7-1 8-7 10-0

For S1 1inch - 254 mm 1 foot = 304 8 mm. | pound per square foot = 47 9 N'm*

2003, 2006, 2009, and 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

(Ord. No. 2013-12, §§ 2, 4(Exh. A), 2-26-2013)

Secs. 22-423—22-440. - Reserved.

Page 51



